
Part IV:  Transcript of Evening Public Hearing,
August 8, 2000



North Carolina Division of Water Resources Central Coastal Plain Capacity Use Area Rules
Environmental Management Commission Hearing Officers’ Report – November 2000

IV-1

Transcript of Evening Public Hearing
August 8, 2000

Hearing Officer:  Ryan Turner

My name is Ryan Turner and I am a member of the North Carolina Environmental
Management Commission.  I have been designated to preside at this hearing along with
Leo Green and Bob Cook, both members of the EMC.  Bob Cook couldn’t be with us
tonight.

This public hearing is being held in compliance with state rulemaking requirements.  The
public notice for this hearing was sent to municipalities, counties, sanitary districts,
consulting engineers, environmental groups, conservation organizations, appropriate state
agencies, and interested individuals.  The notice will be recorded as part of this hearing.

The purpose of the hearing is to obtain public comment on adoption of 15A NCAC 2E
.0501 through .0507, amendment of 15A NCAC 2E .0106 and .0107, and repeal of 15A
NCAC 2E .0102, .0103, .0201, .0202, and .0205.  No official action will be taken during
this hearing since the record will be left open until September 15, 2000.  This will afford
an opportunity for anyone who wishes to submit additional written comments.  After that
time the summary of views expressed  by the public and the staff recommendations will
be presented to the EMC for final action before being presented to the Rules Review
Commission and the General Assembly.

Each person who registers and indicates a desire to make a statement will be recognized
and given an opportunity to present that statement.  Any person who has not previously
indicated a desire to make a statement will be given the opportunity to do so after all
registered speakers have been heard.  All presentations will be limited to 5 minutes or
less and please don’t feel constrained to take the full 5 minutes if you don’t need it.  If
you have a prepared statement we would like a copy as you come forward to speak.

I will call the persons who have indicated they wish to speak to the podium one at a time
and then I will call up the next person in line so that you can get prepared to follow the
person in front of you.  To assure that our records are complete please indicate clearly
your name and whom you are representing.

As previously stated this hearing is to obtain public comment this is not an adversarial
procedure.  Therefore questions from the audience to persons making presentations will
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not be allowed, however, the hearing officers may question participants for purposes of
clarification and will receive in writing any questions from members of the audience who
wish to direct a question to a staff member or speaker.  We are dealing with ground water
management issues in this hearing which are of great importance to the economic welfare
of North Carolina and we appreciate your attendance today and will listen carefully to
your comments.

Now, Nat Wilson with the Division of Water Resources will present the proposed rule
changes.

[Verbal comments by Nat Wilson, Division of Water Resources follow]

My name is Nat Wilson.  I am the lead hydrogeologist with the Division of Water
Resources.

The proposed CCPCUA includes the following fifteen counties:  Beaufort, Carteret,
Craven, Duplin, Edgecombe, Greene, Jones, Lenoir, Martin, Onslow, Pamlico, Pitt,
Washington, Wayne and Wilson.  Water supplies for the western part of this region come
from the Cretaceous aquifer system, primarily from the Black Creek and Upper Cape
Fear aquifers.  Water levels in these aquifers have been dropping at high rates of one to
eight feet per year for several decades.  Dewatering is known to be occurring in some
areas – this is where water levels have fallen below the top of the aquifer – we know this
condition harms the ability of the aquifer to transmit water.  Beginning in early 1998 we
began meeting with people representing public and private water systems, industries,
agricultural interests, consulting engineers and geologists, municipal and county
governments, and the legislature to discuss how to achieve a reliable water supply for this
area.

One outcome of these discussions was our three-point strategy.  The Division believes it
is important to review these proposed rules in the context of our three-point strategy of
monitoring, planning & regulation:

1. monitoring – an adequate ground water level monitoring network must be operated,
maintained, and improved as needed to provide accurate data on the amount and rate
of ground water level declines;

2. planning – the solution to the water supply problems in the Central Coastal Plain will
involve careful management of Cretaceous aquifer water to use its sustainable yield
while developing other water sources to meet additional needs; and
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3. regulation – the Water Use Act of 1967 provides a basis for regulating water
withdrawals by permit in areas where water use is exceeding the capacity of water
supply.

The EMC approved a rule and we held a public hearing on that rule a year ago.  Public
comments called for a rule that spells things out in more detail.  So, starting in February
of this year and lasting through the first week in April 2000, a group of stakeholders met
weekly to write the rules before you today.  On May 11, 1999 the EMC approved those
draft rules (with just a few modifications) for public hearing (today’s meeting).  I will list
some of the provisions in the rule and refer you to the rule text for further information:

The rule additions and changes before you today provide for permitting of ground water
use by persons using more than 100,000 gallons per day.  Existing withdrawals will
continue under interim status until permits are issued or denied.  All municipal, industrial,
and agricultural water users will follow standard water conservation measures to assure
efficient use of water.  Permit holders will report water use rates to allow the total
demand on the aquifers to be better understood.  Ground water users from 10,000 to
100,000 gallons per day will not need permits, but must register and report annual water
use.  Surface water users of more than 10,000 gallons per day must register and report
annual water use.  Agricultural water users not required to obtain a permit may report
water use through confidential NCDA or USDA surveys rather than the Division of
Water Resources.  Temporary permits allow more time for compliance with permit
conditions if events occur beyond the control of the permittee.  Water use permit holders
may transfer or sell water to other users within permitted amounts.

Four Cretaceous aquifer zones are defined in the rule:  Dewatering, Saltwater
Encroachment, Declining Water Level, and those parts of Edgecombe, Wilson, Wayne
and Duplin counties outside of the named zones.  Permittees in the salt water water
encroachment and dewatering zones face 75% reductions in water use from the
Cretaceous aquifers over three successive 25% reduction phases in the 6th, 11th, and 16th

year after the effective date of the rule.  Permittees in the declining water level zone face
30% reduction in water use from the Cretaceous aquifers over three successive 10%
reduction phases occurring in the 6th, 11th, and 16th year after the effective date of the rule.
Stable water use is required from the Cretaceous aquifers for permittees in the western
parts of Edgecombe, Wilson, Wayne and Duplin counties, outside of the other three
zones.  The EMC can adjust the zone map and reduction amounts in the 6th, 11th, and 16th

year based on current aquifer conditions.
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Intermittent water users who use water less than 60 days a year or who use less than 15
million gallons per year will not be required to reduce water use in the three reduction
phases.  The rule provides for initial permits that can allow for increasing withdrawals
during the first 6-year period to provide for growth in demand as supplemental water
supplies are being planned and implemented.  The purpose of this rule is to assure that
the capacity of aquifers to yield water for future needs is protected.  To meet future water
needs, additional water sources must be developed to complement the Cretaceous
aquifers.

I will now turn the meeting back over to Mr. Ryan Turner.  Thank you.

Hearing Officer:  Ryan Turner

The first person to speak this evening is James Taylor followed by Mitch Peele.

[Written copy of verbal comments by James Taylor, Southeastern Wayne Sanitary
District follow]



North Carolina Division of Water Resources Central Coastal Plain Capacity Use Area Rules
Environmental Management Commission Hearing Officers’ Report – November 2000

IV-5



North Carolina Division of Water Resources Central Coastal Plain Capacity Use Area Rules
Environmental Management Commission Hearing Officers’ Report – November 2000

IV-6

Hearing Officer:  Ryan Turner

Mitch Peele followed by Todd Bollick.

[Written copy of verbal comments by Mitch Peele, North Carolina Farm Bureau
Federation follow]



North Carolina Division of Water Resources Central Coastal Plain Capacity Use Area Rules
Environmental Management Commission Hearing Officers’ Report – November 2000

IV-7



North Carolina Division of Water Resources Central Coastal Plain Capacity Use Area Rules
Environmental Management Commission Hearing Officers’ Report – November 2000

IV-8



North Carolina Division of Water Resources Central Coastal Plain Capacity Use Area Rules
Environmental Management Commission Hearing Officers’ Report – November 2000

IV-9



North Carolina Division of Water Resources Central Coastal Plain Capacity Use Area Rules
Environmental Management Commission Hearing Officers’ Report – November 2000

IV-10

Hearing Officer:  Ryan Turner

Todd Bollick followed by Paul Busick.

[Verbal comments by Todd Bollick, Town of Bethel follow]

My name is Todd Bollick and I am from the Town of Bethel which is in northern Pitt
County.  Our town is a member of the Central Coastal Plain Capacity Use Area
Association.  In the session this afternoon our Chairman, Richard Hicks gave a
presentation, we agree with and fully support his comments.  We would like to add our
little bit.

Bethel, like everybody else here, agrees that we do have a problem with water withdrawal
from the Cretaceous aquifers and we do need to work to resolve it.  We also feel that the
rule that is proposed now is a starting point and not a finished solution.  The things that
we would like to see included are:  we would like to see the proposed cost addressed as it
appears in the rule.  It appears to be grossly underestimated.  The cost to communities
and water users is going to be far greater than what it shows.  Our community for one, I
don’t know if we can afford it.  It is nice to conserve water as it is all natural resources,
but we need to conserve the communities that use this water.  To conserve the water and
not have anybody left to use it, that is going to defeat it.

Thank you.

Hearing Officer:  Ryan Turner

Paul Busick followed by Tony Ballance.

[Written copy of verbal comments by Admiral Paul Busick, President, North
Carolina Global Transpark Authority follow]
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Hearing Officer:  Ryan Turner

Tony Ballance followed by Brent Turner.

[Written copy of verbal comments by Tony Ballance, Balance Farms, Inc follow]
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Hearing Officer:  Ryan Turner

Brent Turner followed by Landis Davis.

[Verbal comments by Brent Turner, Guilford Mills, Inc follow]
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My name is Brent Turner.  I am the Director of Engineering for the Automotive Business
Unit of Guilford Mills.  I thank you for the opportunity of letting me come and speak
today.

We represent an industry and I wanted to read a statement that says Guilford Mills
believes that ground water resources in the coastal plain are very valuable and they need
to be protected.  We do believe that sustainable use of ground water resources is a worthy
goal.  We also believe that continued economic growth and development in the coastal
plain is a worthy goal.  It is a belief at Guilford Mills that the proposed rules of this
community do not adequately address manufacturing facilities in the affected area.  We
believe the proposed rules will add a burden to growing companies in the area while
allowing businesses that are not providing economic growth to shoulder less of the load
in this conservation effort.  We do feel that the water usage can be reduced even while a
company is growing.  This could be done through improvements in processes as well as
other conservation techniques.  Guilford Mills recommends that the definition for
approved base rate in Section .0507(1) of the proposed rule change be changed as
follows:  the definition of approved base rate should contain a provision that allows
facilities to use a production unit base rate versus a total volume rate.  For example, the
industrial facility could choose to have an approved base rate set on X numbers of gallons
per pound of production for the time periods listed in the proposed rule.  This base rate
would be used in other sections of the rule to determine required water and efficiency
improvements.  The advantages of this are discussed below:  as proposed in the rule
currently it potentially limits the growth of certain industries and facilities in the affected
areas.  The proposed rule requires phased annual water reduction based on an approved
base rate.  The approved base rate does not take into account production levels of
industrial facilities, companies that are growing and creating additional economic
opportunities in the area are penalized with that growth compared to a company that is
not growing and not creating the additional economic opportunities.  As a result a
growing company may choose to locate additional production capacity at facilities
outside the area.  On the other hand the company may be faced to remove its
manufacturing capabilities in the area.  We believe that the production base rate in a
subsequent annual water usage efficiency improvement requirements will be a more
equitable way of providing a sustainable use of ground water to the area.  In this way
growing companies would be assured that the burden of reducing water use and
increasing water use efficiency would be shared by other industries and entities in the
area.  In addition it would not provide incentives for companies to move production and
jobs out of the area in order to meet annual water reduction requirements.  All facilities
would be encouraged to improve the matter of efficiency starting at the 1st phase of the
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program.  One of the components that I wanted to add that Mr. Wilson said and I wrote
down, it says that ensured efficient use of water and we don’t see how not addressing
growing companies can do that.  We feel that we can grow and be better at reducing our
water consumption but it’s not fair to reduce our growth and where a company that cuts
its manufacturing to half and moves it out of the area will benefit because they will be
divided by the rules that you have set forth.  We feel by doing a base rate on
manufacturing production by unit, by pound, by yard, by some measurement means
needs to be addressed to these rules that way the growing industries will have an
incentive to stay and just become better water users.

I appreciate the time.
Thank you.

Hearing Officer:  Ryan Turner

Landis Davis followed by Jean Hood.

[Written copy of verbal comments by Landis Davis, Belfast-Patetown Sanitary
District, Wayne County follow]
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Hearing Officer:  Ryan Turner

Jean Hood followed by Jerry Bean.

[Written copy of verbal comments by Jean Hood, Chairman, Southwestern Wayne
Sanitary District follow]
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Hearing Officer:  Ryan Turner

Jerry Bean followed by Dr. Richard Spruill.

[Written copy of verbal comments by Jerry Bean, Eastern Wayne Sanitary District
follow]
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Hearing Officer:  Ryan Turner

Dr. Richard Spruill followed by David Pittman.

[Verbal comments by Richard Spruill, East Carolina University follow]

Mr. Green, Mr. Turner, I appreciate this opportunity to speak to you.  In the late 1970’s a
great citizen of Lenoir County here named Ralph Heath published a book in which he
pointed out water resources in the Central Coastal Plain were already declining.  The
declines were the result of serious overdraft of the aquifer systems and we needed to take
action with respect to these problems of decline as early as the late 1970’s.  I had the
great honor and privilege of sitting in his hydrology class and actually passing it at North
Carolina State in 1985, in which he gave a lecture giving in great detail the situation here
in the Central Coastal Plain involving decline of a Cretaceous Aquifer System.  Ralph
retired soon after and the work continued at the US Geological Survey along with the
work at the Division of Water Resources and a few scientists out here in the real world
working on the effects of pumping and overpumping on our aquifer system and the
feasibility of continuing development of the aquifers and the conclusion reached by all
these scientists and regulatory agencies and as first put forward by Ralph Heath is a
simple one, that is that since at least the 1960’s water levels are declining at precipitous
rates throughout the central coastal plain.  They are declining for one simple reason, and
that is, we are taking more water out of them than is reaching these deep, high quality
aquifers.  That’s a significant problem and it is a problem that we have a good handle on.
We know where the problems are, we know where the problem areas are.  We also think
we know what some of the solutions are and I will come back to that in a second.

I worked hard on the rule for the last 10 or 15 years just trying to get people to think
about a rule and serve as a scientific advisor to the stakeholders group.  It was a really
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interesting group of people, I think all dedicated to coming up with a solution to this
problem.  I think the rule that is before you will effectively do a series of things.  First, I
think it will curtail the overdraft of the aquifers in a stepwise, time fashion aimed at what
I call the safe yield of the aquifer system.  I think the safe yield of the cretaceous aquifer
system in the central coastal plain maybe about a fourth of the withdrawal rate currently
being taken from the aquifer.  I think we can curtail that overdraft in a step wise fashion
with this rule.  I think the rule effectively protects these vital resources in a sustainable
way then and will allow us to develop the maximum amount of groundwater from these
aquifers for continued growth and development of the coastal plain.  I think this rule will
allow effective protection which will include the mitigation or at least slowing of the
rates of salt water migration towards some of our vital well fields throughout the central
coastal plain, both by lateral salt water encroachment and by salt water moving upwards
beneath some of our pumping centers.  I think that the capacity use area rule as proposed
will effectively help to reduce land subsidence.  I hear a lot about the economic woes
with Floyd, and my house went under with Floyd, I would like for you to think about this,
if land is subsiding throughout the coastal plain in response to withdrawal of water from
our aquifers can we imagine one foot of land subsidence.  If you are in Greenville, the
difference between a 100 year flood plain and a 500 year flood plain with respect to
elevations is 5 feet, if we loose an additional foot of land surface caused by overpumping
of our aquifer system just think what Floyd will do to us then.  I think the rule will
effectively foster research and add a research component to the development of our
aquifer in the coastal plain.  What we have is development, development, development.
The research has come from the regulatory agencies and some scientists.  Lets add a
research component, but let’s add something in the rule that says that the Division of
Water Resources will effectively deal with the research provided by the users of this
resource out here in the real world and perhaps that is missing in some places in the rule
now.  I think the rule, finally, effectively will force us to look at alternative sources of
water.

I want to say that there are solutions to the problems out there.  We can use water over
again, we can utilize other aquifers, we can store water underground, we can use surface
water in conjunction with our ground water.  I believe that the rule is necessary to protect
our vital ground water and fresh ground water resources.  The rule is based on enough
scientific data.  We know where the problem is, we have known since the 70’s where the
problem areas are, we know effectively where those areas are.  It’s time for us to start
taking some action.  What I hear from our interaction with all the people out here in the
real world are concerns that mainly center around cost.  I am convinced that we have not
really looked at cost very well.  It will, let’s all remember this, cost us to develop our
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water resources in the future because our demands are increasing.  There is going to be a
certain cost for developing water resources.  I am not sure that we really have a handle on
how much more it will cost us to develop those water resources to meet our needs in the
future in the face of the rule.  I think it will be more.  What I point out that we are not in a
crisis situation yet, we don’t have a crisis in the coastal plain, we are trying to prevent a
crisis.  I am convinced that the cost of dealing with this situation now will be
significantly less than the cost of dealing with this situation when the crisis occurs down
the road.

Finally, I would like to point out that over the last couple of years, I have developed great
confidence in the scientific staff of the Division of Water Resources.  I think that they can
effectively administer a good rule and I think they produced a good rule for us.  Our tasks
should be to work together to make this good rule an excellent rule.

Thank you.

Hearing Officer:  Ryan Turner

David Pittman followed by Sondra Riggs.

[Written copy of verbal comments by David Pittman, Northwestern Wayne Sanitary
District follow]
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Hearing Officer:  Ryan Turner

Sondra Riggs followed by Arthur Kennedy.

[Verbal comments by Sondra Ipock Riggs, Jones County Commissioner follow]

Hi I am Sondra Ipock Riggs.  I am a Jones County Commissioner and I am here
representing Jones County.  My other group was here this afternoon.  I just would like to
thank John.  We asked him to do this 4 or 5 years ago when we heard of the decrease in
the water because it really upset me, my family, my grandchildren and everyone else.

As you know the rules and regulations that Water Quality and DENR and everybody else
have passed in the last 4 or 5 years, I have been opposed to 80% of it because the
majority of them, me as a retired farmer and I am just not a woman that just cooks, I
would drive combines and everything else like the rest of you men, but some of these
rules and regulations you know were unnecessary.  Now let me tell you what my theory
is on this, it is the same thing as with digging up the gas tanks, they out to put the little
man out of business.  This is going to put the little farmers out of business and anybody
else that has got a small water supply and I tell you why.  I have already been contacted, I
better not say the name because I don’t have it on tape, it starts with an “E,” has
contacted us for them to come to our county and sell water.  Let me tell you something
this sister will never vote to buy water as much water as we are sitting on in Jones County
and as the gentleman said here today, we probably have got the biggest Castle Hayne
water under Jones County than anywhere in any of the other 15 counties.  When I was
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chairman of the Neuse River Council, John Bayer and all these people that are on the
board in the back that’s with me, I urged the 11 counties to join the 15 counties for all of
us to hook up county line to line, I urged John and them to submit this to other counties.
Let me tell you my reason for this, anybody can come into your county and put a well
there and there is nothing you can do about it and they will be coming.  I know all of you
have heard the Neuse River on 20/20 and everything else, well I was raised on the Neuse
River and most of all that is a pile of junk.  I went down there swimming Sunday, there is
nothing wrong with me today.  We fish down there about every 3 days, but we won’t get
into that.  What I want to tell you is another, I do not believe that the water is getting
short, I do not doubt Mr. Spruill but let me tell you what our state governments fail to do,
thank God he’ll be getting out pretty soon, it will probably even get worse.  What we
need to do is implement the money to study this to give it to the towns, I’ve got a $3
million grant that I can’t do a darn thing with except to fix the Black Creek.  We all know
the Black Creek is going dry, but I still have to put wells on it and the state doesn’t have
sense enough to tell me to put it on the Castle Hayne.  I have got to go by the same rules.
You see what I am telling you and I am not the smartest person in this room, not the
smartest person in the world, but I’m not the dumbest either and I have been around a
long time in these politics, 38 years, and believe me there is a money making deal behind
this.  I have already seen it.  I was in Goldsboro last Friday the 1st thing I was approached
with was to start buying from this company that wanted to buy out of Aurora but don’t
fall for that children.  There are other ways to go.  Who in the devil wants to pump it
from the mountains and go on the coast and pump it back, that’s sick.

Thank you.

Hearing Officer:  Ryan Turner

Arthur Kennedy followed by Steve Hines.

[Written copy of verbal comments by Arthur Kennedy, President, The Wooten
Company follow]
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Hearing Officer:  Ryan Turner

Steve Hines followed by Ed Andrews.
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[Verbal comments by Steve Hines, Eastern Carolina Council follow]

Mr. Speaker, Ladies and Gentlemen.  I am not a professional engineer, I am not a
hydrologist.  I represent the nine member counties of the Eastern Carolina Council.
Many of you may not know me at this time because I have just recently come aboard.  I
am a native of Onslow County and so therefore I have grown up and lived in one of the
counties that is under consideration.

The counties that I represent in the Eastern Carolina Council are:  Onslow, Duplin,
Carteret, Jones, Craven, Pamlico, Lenoir, Greene and Wayne.  All of these counties are
located within the proposed CCPCUA.  Much has been said this evening and earlier
today about the potential negative impact upon these 15 counties in this proposed
CCPCUA.  It can not be understated that should these proposals as currently presented be
enacted, it will not lead to the ultimate goal of assisting these counties in the CCPCUA, it
will put restrictions at this point and time on our communities that many are ill-prepared
nor capable to overcome at this time.  The continuing process of redevelopment from
Hurricane Floyd as well as the mass reduction in tobacco crop production, affecting all of
the 15 counties, by the way, in some way shape or form, require that what additional
resources are available in an area be targeted to a great extent toward the successful
emergence from these economic challenges.  I have heard many of the speakers today
remark that our communities are aware that there is a problem as well as other comments
evidencing that several of our communities are actively moving toward the development
of alternative water resources.  It is apparent that within the proposed CCPCUA there is
now an overall awareness that there is a problem.  Time is of the essence but it is time
coupled with financial resources to develop alternatives that is needed.  The communities
of the proposed CCPCUA are similar yet they all face diverse challenges.  Likewise it
would be very difficult to say the least to lump all of our counties and municipalities into
the same basket, each community needs and deserves the time necessary to develop,
obtain financing and implement their plans for alternative water resources in their
respective communities.  In some of our communities water alternatives are more
accessible than others.  We must pledge our joint resources in enabling all our
communities to develop these resources while remaining cognizant to the needs of our
communities that are plagued by low wealth and low tax-based economies.  Certainly
water is at the very essence of our ability to have quality economic development not only
in the proposed CCPCUA but throughout eastern North Carolina. I urge you to delay
implementation of the proposed rules until further input can be obtained by these
proposed affected communities.  Rules on paper Mr. Speaker have a real impact on
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people, we must ensure that the rules assist and not hurt our citizens as we move forward
into the future.

Thank you.

Hearing Officer:  Ryan Turner

Ed Andrews

[Verbal comments by Ed Andrews, Edwin Andrews Associates follow]

Commissioner, Director.  I want to thank you again for the opportunity.  I made 4 points
earlier this afternoon  but I am not going to reiterate.  One was priority, specificity,
appeal process, and privacy were the 4 issues I talked about.

Now I want to talk about a specific section, get down to some nuts and bolts, as the
commission needs to do in these deliberations.  .0506 CCPCUA Status Reports. I think
there needs to be a provision for local and regional input in development of their own
reports.  If they find that conditions are better than anticipated in the development of
these rates, in other words, there are no adverse impacts in a given aquifer system or
aquifer, then they should have the right to possibly submit a report on their own and I
suggest or propose that line item six, read basically that local government, industries or
permitted water users can submit regional interim reports at any time identifying
significant mitigation of adverse impacts for review by the director.   Seven, a
determination that adverse impacts have been mitigated shall be incorporated by the
director to redefine the zone mapping or result in an alteration of the prescribed water use
reduction where applicable.

Thank you.

Hearing Officer:  Ryan Turner

Does anybody want to speak who did not sign up?  The hearing record remains open until
September 15, 2000 so you may submit written comments up until that date.  Thank you
for showing up this evening.


